Fire Equipment Sales & Service

List Price List Dropbox on Casco website

Same as the last bid, Casco has a link at the
bottom of our public website that all customers
has access to which hosts a dropbox with list
price lists for all of our product offerings. The
folders are in correlation to the OMES
categories. Discounts are also show for each
products in the name of every price list. This
allows for csutomers to know exactly what
discount and what price we can offer for all of
our products.



SUPPLIER'S NAME: Casco Indystries

PRODUCT EXAMPLE PRODUCT MANUFACTURER/IDESCRIPTION UNIT OF EQUAL PRODUCT MANUFACTURER/DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER'S (MSBREL :LIST PERCENTAGE| NET COST
Shits  [5.11 Tactical Poly/Cotion Fleece Y% Zip Shirt Exh  |5.11 Tactical Poly/Cotton Fleece %4 Zip Shirt 72534 75 14% 64.5
Shirts 5.11 Tactical Men's % Zip Shirt with Canvas Collars and Elbows Each 5.11 Tactical Men’s ¥ Zip Shirt with Canvas Collars |72535 75 14% 64.5
Shirts 5.11 Tactical, Tactical S Pola Shirt Each 5.11 Tactical, Tactical SS Polo Shirt 71182 55 15% 46.75
Shirts 5,11 Tactical Professional Long Sieeve Polo Shirt Exh  |5.11 Tactical Professional Long Sleeve Polo Shirt 42056 60 15% 51
Shirts Propper Men's |.C.E. Integrated Cooling Effect Parformance Polo Exh  |Propper Men's L.C.E. Integrated Cooling Effect F5341 39.99 20 31.99
Shirts LION StationWear, Bravo Short Sleeve Uniform Shirt, Poly/Cotton Each LION StationWear, Bravo Short Sleeve Uniform 1576 60.99 37 38.42
Shirts LION StationWear: Bravo Short Sleeve Uniform Shirt, NOMEX IlIA Each LION StationWear: Bravo Short Sleeve Uniform 1457 214.99 37 135.44
Shirts Elbeco: Textrop2 Ladies Choice Short Slesve Shirt Each 5.11 WOMEN'S COMPANY SHORT SLEEVE 61321 70 14 60.2
Shirts Elbeco: Uix Perfomance Tactical Women's Polo Each 5.11 WOMEN’S TACTICAL JERSEY SHORT 61164 55 10 49.5
Shirts Workrite: Men's Classic Short Sleeve Fire Chiaf Shirt Each Workrite: Men's Classic Short Sleeve Fire Chief Shirt |[FSC2 122.85 12 108.11
Pants TRU-SPEC: 24-7 Series, Poly-Cotton Ripstop Men's Pants Each 5.11 TACLITE® PRO RIPSTOP PANT 74273 63 14 54.18
Pants Workrite: Men's Classic Pant Each Workrite: Men's Classic Pant FP26 115.35 12 101.51
Pants 5.11 Tactical: Women's Taclite EMS Pant Each 5.11 Tactical: Women's Taclite EMS Pant 64369 73 14 62.78
Pants 5.11 Tacfical: TDU Poly/Cotton Twill Pants Eaxh  |5.1] Tactical: TDU Poly/Cotton Twill Pants 74003 70 14 60.2
Bafts Boston Leather. 1-3/4* Garison Belt - Leather Exh  |Boston Leather: 1-3/4" Garrison Belt - Leather 6605 25.8 30% 18.06
Belts Boston Leather: 1-1/2" Belt - Leather Each  |Boston Leather: 1-1/2" Belt - Leather 6582 29.3 30 20.51
Belts 5.11 Tactical: TDU Bekts - Polymer Buckie, 1.5° or 1.75" Each  |5.11 Tactical: TDU Belts - Polymer Buckle, 1.5" or  |59551 23 16 19.32
Hats Flexfit, Acrylic-Wool Low Profils Cap Each NO BID
Hats True North: DragoriWear Nomex Flesce, Double Shot Hat Each | True North: DragonWear Nomex Fleece, Double DF910 34.95 8 3215
Hats Flexfit: Heavyweight Cuffed Knit Cap Each NO BID

pat & Holmet | oSweat: Disposatie Ht & Helmet Liner Ech  |NO BID

Shoes/Boots | Thorogood: ASR Biack Leather Slip-On Shoe par | Thorogood: ASR Black Leather Slip-On Shoe 834-6520 58 30 40.6

Shoes/Boots  |Haix Airpower R2 8" Station/EMS Boot with Crosstech, Men's, NFPA Pair NO BID

Shoes/Boots | Thorogood: The Deue 6° Waterproof Side Zip w/ Composite Toe Station Boot Pair Thorogood: The Deuce 6" Waterproof Side Zip w/ 834-6218 170 32 115.6

REP#0900000584 EXHIBIT 4 - STRUGTURAL FIREFIGHTER'S EQUIPMENT _MARKET BASKET EVAL UATION WORKSHEET __
SUPPLIER'S NAME: e

PRODUCT EXAMPLE PRODUCT MANUFACTURER/DESCRIFTION ﬂs?;m EQUAL PRODUCT MANUFACTURERDESCRIPTION “3"”;:””““3 PART |, 157 PRICE "ER"E:"'G MET COST
Helmets Caime NBA Houston Black Leather Helmst, OSHA Certified Each Cairns NBA Houston Black Leather Helmat, OSHA Certified 10176577 1505 28 1083.6
Helmats  |Calns: N5A New Yorker Natural Leather Helmet, OSHA Each Caims: N5A New Yarker Natural Leather Helmel, OSHA 10175107 1415 28 1018.8
Helmeis |Morning Pride: Ben 2Low Rider Helmat NFPA 2013 Cartified Each FH CAIRNS, 1044, BLK, 4" TS, NOMEX 1044FSB 470 28 338.4
Helmets Honeywell: The EV1 Tradilional Firefighting Helmet, with Internal EZ TouchFace Eye Protection, NFPA Each FH CAIRNS, 1044, BLK, DEF CLR, NOMEX (10100952 515 28 370.8
Helmats | Caitns: 1044 Helmat, Black, NFPA, OSHA Each Cairns: 1044 Helmet, Black, NFPA, OSHA 1044DDB 560 28 4032
Hoods Majestic: PAC (i, 100% Nomex, Black, NFPA 1971-2013 Each Majastic: PAC 1Il, 100% Nomex, Black, NFPA 1971-2013 100% NX BLK/ |72.8 30 50.96
Hoods PG: Cobra™ Ultimate™ Carbon Shisld™ Haod, NFPA Cerlified Each PGI: Cobra™ Uliimate™ Carbon Shield™ Hood, NFPA Certified 30400-00-192098|40.82 17 33.88
Hoods Majestic: PAC Il Ultra C6, SVZ, NFPA 1671-2013 Each Majsstic: PAC If Ullra C6, SVZ, NFPA 1671-2013 C6 PACII-DS  [80.22 30 56.15
Gloves Ergodyne ProFlex Fire & Rescue Performance Gloves Pair VERIDIAN CASCO GREEN CASCO GREEN [127 30 88.9
Gloves Fite Pro If Struclural Fire Glova Pair veridian Fire Pro II Structural Fire Glove FIRE PRO II 117 30 81.9
Gloves Pro Tech 8 Titan Kangaroo Structural Glove, Short Cuff Pair PRO-TECH 8 TITAN-K PRO STRUCTURAL GLOVE PT-8 TNK SC 172 30 120.4
Gloves Fire Armor Struclural Fire Glove Pair Veridian: Fire Armor Structural Firsfighting Glova, NFPA FIRE ARMOR 171 30 119.7
Gloves | Pro-Tech & TITAN-K Structural Firefighting Glove, Kangaroo Lealher/Kevlar, NFPA 1971- Peir PRO-TECH 8 TITAN-K PRO STRUCTURAL GLOVE PT-§ TNK.SC  |172 30 120.4




Gloves Honeywell: Kangaroo Leather Cadet Size Super Glove, NFPA Pair |Honeywell: Kangaroo Leather Cadet Size Super Glave, NFPA 5285 187 13 162.69
Gloves Veridian: Fire Armor Slructural Firefighting Glove, NFPA Pair Veridian: Fire Amor Structural Firefighting Glove, NFPA FIRE ARMOR 171 30 119.7
Gloves Shelby 5292 Tuff Glove Structural Firefighling Glove with Gauntlet Pair Shelby 5292 Tuff Glove Structural Firsfighting Glove with Gauntlet 5292 193.5 5 183.82
Eye Proteclion  |Conway/Lion: Faceshield, 4" x.150 Apec (Thumbwhesl Styls) Each MSA CAIRNS: FACESHIELD ASSY, 4, PKG, |10037315 105 28 75.6
Eye Protection | Conway/Lion; Faceshield Hardware, Thumbwhest Each MSA CAIRNS: 660C/664 FACESHIELD S910P 75 28 54
Eye Protection  |Bulfard: 6 Polycarbonals, Hard Coated Face:shield Each Builard: 6" Polycarb Hard Coated F: 680P 14.05 20 11.24
Eye Proteclion  |Bullard; Faceshield Mounting Hardwars Kit Fach Bullard: Facashield Mounting Hardware Kit R151 53.5 30 37.45
Eye Proteclion  {Innerzone 1 NFPA Goggle System With Mounting Brackets. Each Cairns ESS Firefighter Goggles with mounting  |S549P 155 28 111.6
Eye Proteclion |ESS: FiraPro-1971 FS Structural Firefighting Goggle Kit, Full Strap, NFPA 2013 Each Cairns ESS Firefighter Goggles with mounting | S549P 155 28 111.6
Boots Hellfire Rubber Falt Incuiated Bool, Lug Sole Pair LION Heflfire Rubber Fekt insulated Bool, Lug Sole 807-6003 304 37 191.52
Boots Globe: Men's Supreme 14" Structural Fire Bool Pull-On, NFPA Pair Globe: Men's Supreme 14° Struciural Fire Boot Pull-On, NFPA 1201420 800 25 600
Boots Thotogood: 14" Oblique Toe Structurat Baol, NFPA Pair Thorogood: 14° Obliqua Tos Struclural Boct, NFPA 804-6373 140 30 98
Boots Pro Warringlon: 5006 Utlimate Power 14* Buniker Boot, NFPA Pair LION by Thorogood QR 14 14" Structural Bunker|804-6369 644 37 405.72
Bools Honeywall: Ranger Series Model 1500 Insulated Rubber Boots, 16°, NFPA Pair BLACK DIAMOND; NFPA 16" Lug Sole, 6999451 224.99 15 191.24
Boots HAIX: FIRE HERO XTREME 11" Leather Bunker Boot, Mens, NFPA Pair NO BID
Boots Globe Men's Shadow 14* All-black Leather Structural Fire Boot, Pull-On, NFPA Pair Globe Men's Shadaw 14° All-black Leather Structural Fire Boot, Puff-On, NFPA 1501420 769 25 576.75
Boots Honeywall; Ranger Series Model 1000 Insulated Rubber Boots, 15", NFPA Pair LION/THOROGOOD HELLFIRE KEVLAR 807-6000
Boots Tk ] Wh ‘s Rubber Insulated Feit Fire Boot With Lug Sole, NFPA Pair Thoregaod Women's Rubber Insulated Felt Fire Boot With Lug Sole, NFPA 507-6003 304 37 191.52
Tumott Gear - | yobs: TheFireStore Spac Clessix Cost Exh  |No Bid
Tumout Gear - Coats | Fire-Dex: Nomex [l Dsluxe ChisRain Express Tumout Gear Coat with Q8 Thermal Liner and Stedair 3000 Each No Bid

Tumgma(;ear - |Morning Pride: TheFireStore Spac Structural Firefighting Bunker Gear, NFPA 1871 - Jacket Each No Bid

Turngl;ta iear Lion: V-Force TFS, 37" Bi-Swing Tumaut Coat Each gi%?fégl; JZG%RT;I; ;};ﬁ).g‘ARMOR AP/ 1D462D1T 310339 |38 1924.1
Turnout Gear - Coats| Fire Dex: Gold FXA Express Coat, 7.2 0z Advance-NomexKeviar Each No Bid

Tumout Gear -  |Globe: TheFireStore Spec Classix Pants Pair No Bid

Tum’:;ﬂéear - FirQ-Dex: me Ill Deluxe Chisftain Express Tumout Gear Pants with Q8 Thermal Liner and Sledair 3000 Pair No Bid
TumoulF:saI: - Pants |Fire-Dex: Gemini XT FX-M Express Tumout Geer Pants with Caldura SL2i Therma! Liner and Stedair 4000 Pair No Bid

Turn;uig Gear - rom(ng Pride: TheFireStore Spec Struclurat Firefighting Bunker Gear, NFPA 1971 - Pait No Bid

a0 il .

TNeEe S Vo T8 e P ) come prton " [FD462DIR 229869 [38 1425.19
Tools Fire Axe, inc. LAFD Polished Steel Pick Head Firsfighter Axe, 6 b, Each FIRE HOOKS UNLIMITED CHROME PICK  |CPA-6F 186 9 169.26
Tods  |Fire Hooks Uniimited  Ibe 36" Chrome Forcibie Entry Avo with Manying Siol, Fiberglzss Each TR TPV 8 o0 LATON TG R o W W i FA-8 WA-8 204 30 142.8
Tools [Akron Roof Hook, Compact 17* All-Stoel Multi-Purpose NY-style Hook, Fulorum Chisel Each LEATHERHEAD Roof Hook, Compact 17" All- INYH-17 104 30 72.8
Todls Leatherhead NY-Styls Hook with Angled Chiss! at Foot Each Leatherhoad NY-Styla Hook with Angled Chisl at Foot NYH-6 184 30 128.8
Todls Auzel All-Stainless 1 Piece Forged Steel Halligan Bar Each LEATHERHEAD 24" Halligan Bar (Forged LB-24 358 30 250.6
Tools Council Single Forged Allow Stes! Halligan Style Farcible Entry Tool Each Council Single Forged Allow Steel Halligan Style Forcible Entry Tool HAL1P30 287.55 20 230.04
Tools Tempast Technology VentMaster Hi Pro 576HD Flre/R: Chain Saw Each Tempast Technology VentMaster Husqvama Pro 576HD Fire/Rescus Chain Saw TV400-081 3422 21 2703.38
Todls (Akron 58" Round or Square Poinl Shovels, Uttra-Lite Handle Each ZICO Square point--48” handle 4065-267-000 59.35 20 47.48
Tools Council Tool Sledge Hammer Each Council Tool Sledge Hammer PR100016 50.94 20 40.75
Tols LonaStar Axe The PIG Forcible Entry Tool, 8 Ibs. Each LoneStar Axe The PIG Forcible Entry Todl, 8 b, NOT32 352 30 246.44
Tadds [FreHooks Unlimited; FO-760 Forciblo Enry Saw Eh  |FIRE HOOKS UNLIMITED FD 770 12" FD770PKG 3289 |30 2302.3
Tools Channallock The 89 Raseue Toal with Cable Cutter Each NO BID
Tools EMI Windaw Punch, Adjustable Tension Each FIRE HOOKS UNLIMITED: SPRING SP-1 11 7 10.23
Tools Emi First-in Roscus Kil Each FIRE HOOKS UNLIMITED: AUTO RESCUE [ARK 26 7 24.18




Tools Fire Hooks Unllimiled The FireMaxx 14-in-1 Tool Each Fire Hooks Unliimited The FireMaxx 14-in-1 Tocl |FIREMX22 I 174 | 11 | 154.86
RFP# 0300000564 EXHIBIT 5 - WILOLAND FIREFIGHTER'S EQUIPMENT MARKET BASKET EVALUATION WORKSHEET
SUPPLIER'S NAME: __ Casco Industries
PRODUCT EXAMPLE PRODUCT MANUFACTURER/DESCRIPTION UNIT OF EQUAL PRODUGT MANUFACTURER/DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER'S PART || |STPRICE  |PERCENTAGE| NET COST
Boots Pro Warrington: 3003 8" Wildland/Station Boot, NFPA 1977 Pair GLOBE: Station/Wildland 10” Berry Compliant F201050 671 25 503.25
Buots Haix; Airpower XR1 Duak-Certified Wildland, EMS, Station Boot, NFPA Pair GLOBE: EMS/Wildland 10” 2201060 800 25 600
Boots Thorogoods 10” Wildland Hslifre Fire Boot Pair NO BID
Boots Thorogoods 9" Helffire Wildland Boot Pair Thorogoods 9” Hellfire Wildland Boot 804-6379 552 37 347.76
Boots Thorogoods 10” Wildland Boot with Zipper Pair NO BID
Boots 10 1-Met Structural/TRI/Wildiand Boat Pair NO BID
Boots Hercules V2 9" Leather Wildland Boot Pair NO BID
Gloves Pro-Tech 8: Fusion Structural / Wildland Firefighting and Extrication Glove, Pair Pro-Tech 8: Fusion Structural / Wildland Firefighting |PT-8 SC 110 30 77
Gloves Shelby Pigskin Wdland/Rescue Glove Pair Shelby Pigskin Wildland/Rescue Glove 5002 68.5 5 65.08
Pants FeldFire CrewBoss Nomex Brush Pant Pair CREW BOSS Interface Brush Pants, NFPA 6.0 OZ |IFP0105 282 8 259.44
Pants Coaxsher CX Wildland Brush Pant Pair PGI: Nomex IIIA (6 oz) - Yellow GROUND 7500272-C4 254.15 16 213.49
Pants Coaxsher CX Wildland Vent Brush Pant Pair PGI: Nomex HIA (6 oz) - Yellow DOUBLE DUTY |7500272-C9 304.29 16 255.6
Pants Vactor Wildland Fire Pant Pair PGI: Nomex IIIA (6 oz) Navy (84), GROUND 7500284-C4 266.85 16 224,15
Pants CX Wikdland Vent Pant, Tecasafe Pair PGI: Tecasafe Plus (7 oz) - Yellow DOUBLE 7501672-C9 255.42 16 214.55
Pants Crew Boss: Interface Brush Pants, NFPA Pair CREW BOSS Interface Brush Pants, NFPA 6.0 OZ [IFP0105 282 8 259.44
Shirts Vector Wildiand Fire Shirt Each PGI: Tecasafe Plus (7 oz) - Yellow GROUND 5501672-C4 224.76 16 188.8
Shirts Coaxsher CX Wildiand Brush Shirt Each PGI: Tecasafe Plus (7 oz) - Yellow SMOKECHASER [5501672 399.75 16 335.79
Shirts Stryker Wildland Fire Shirt Each PGI: Tecasafe Plus (5.8 oz) - Yellow 4503372
Shirts Beta Wildland Fire Shirt Each NO BID
Shirts BetaX Wildiand Fire Shirt Each PGI: Tecasafe Plus (7 oz) - Yellow SHIRT 4501672 129.64 16 108.9
Jumpsuits Firefine Wikdfland Jumpsut, 9 oz Indura Cotton or 6 oz Nomex IIIA Each PGI: Ultra Soft (9 oz) - Yellow SMOKECHASER  |6501872 587.08 16 493.15
Coats/Jackets  |Coaxsher. CX Urban Interface Coat Each PGI: Tecasafe Plus (7 oz) - Yellow 5501672 399.75 16 335.79
Coatshackets  |Veridian Limited's Wildland Jacket Each VERIDIAN: Wildland Coat Compliance Level: CWLD-D29-0004537 30 3759
CoatsiJackets  |PGI Fireling Wildland Coat, Yetiow Nomex HIA Each PGI Fireline Wildland Coat, Yellow Nomex IITA 5500272 437.13 17 362.82
Coats/Jacksts  |Crew Boss: Interface Wildland/Urban Coat, NFPA 1977 Each CREW BOSS INTERFACE BRUSH COAT 7.0 OZ. |{IFC0117 314 8 288.88
Heimets Bullard Wildland Hefmet Hat Each BULLARD 'Thermoplastic Wildfire cap-style helmet |FH911C 78.8 22 61.46
Helmets Phenix First Due Series WILDLAND Version - OSHA Compliant Each CAIRNS: FH CAIRNS, 3608, YEL, 4" STD, 360SFSY 430 28 309.6
Faoe Masks/Shrouds |Hot Shield Wildland Firefighter Face Mask Each Hot Shield Wildland Firefighter Face Mask HS-2 85 12 74.8
Face Hot Shiekd UNIV@ Ultra Shroud Extreme Each Hot Shield UNI-V(@ Ultra Shroud Extreme UNI-V2 60 12 52.8
Face Masks/Shrouds |GX Wildland Helmet Shroud Each PGI- Lined Helmet Shroud - Nomex IIIA (6 oz) - 3650272 46.09 17 38.25
Goggles  [Widland Fire Odyssey I Goggles Each Caimns ESS Firefighter Goggles 5549p 155 28 111.6
Firefighting | indian Backpack Firefighting Pumps-Galvanized Each PECO SALES: 85700 85700 22999 |5 218.49
Firefighting Pumps|Smith Indian Fire Pump, Steel Wikdland Fire Tank with Pump, 5 Galion Each PECO SALES: 85701 85701 300 5 285
Firefighting Pumps|Smith 500 FSV Fedco SmokeChaser Collapsible Heavy Duty Viny! Witdland Indian Fire Each PECO SALES: 85130 85130 189.99 5 180.49
Firefighting Pumps{Smith Indian Fire Pump, Chief 5-Gallon Heavy-Duty Dual Bag Nylon Fire Pump Each PECO SALES: 85230 85230 229.99 5 218.49
Firefighting Pumps|Hale Fyr Pak Backpack Pump Each Hale FYR-PAK PUMP, RECMD SPARES KIT 546-1550-55-0  |680 5% 646
Drip Torch Forestry Suppliers Sure-Seal Double-Bottom Drip Torch Each PECO SALES: 85022 85022 164 5 155.8
Drip Torch Mercedes Textiies Drip Tarch, 1.2 US Gallon Capacity Each NO BID
Wildiand Pack | True North Spitfire Wildland Pack Each True North Spitfire Wildland Pack SPF3210 229.95 8 211.55
Wildland Pack  |Coaxsher SR-1 Endeavor Search and Rescug Pack Each TRUE NORTH: Fireﬂy Pack FRF8213 284.95 8 262.15




Wildiand Pack | Coaxsher FS-1 Spotter Mid-Weight Wildland Fire Pack Each TRUE NORTH: Fireball Pack FBL4213 20495 |8 188.55
Wiklland Pack  |Coaxsher FS-1 Ranger Wikdland Fire Pack Each TRUE NORTH: Spitfire Pack SPF3213 220,95 8 211.55
Wildland Pack | Coaxsher FS-1 Mojave Lightwaight Wikiland Fire Pack Each TRUE NORTH: Spyder Gear Pack SGR6210 174.95 8 160.95
Wiidiand Pack | Ranger/Endeavor 1500¢i Pack Each TRUE NORTH: Fireball Bag FBL4104 134.95 8 124.15
Wildland Pack | Alpha-10 Fire Line Pack Syster Each TRUE NORTH: Phantom Pack PHT7210 35995 (8 331.15
_ ForsslFila | Anchor Industries New Generation Fire Shetter Each PECO SALES: 35918 35918 513 5 487.35
Radio Holstar, Hip Case, | Coaxsher Mini Radio Holster Each TRUE NORTH: Stealth Radio Chest Harness RH6500 49.95 8 45.95
Redio Holster, Hip | Muti-Use Hip-Case Each TRUE NORTH: Frontline Personal Pouch FLPP100 29.95 8 27.55
Redio Holstar, Hp Cas=, | Coaxsher DR-1 Commander Dual Radio Chest Hamess Each TRUE NORTH: Dual Radio Chest Harness RH6200 74.95 8 68.95
Tools Council Tools 3.75ib Pulaski Axe Each Council Tools 3.751b Pulaski Axe 38PE136 88.08 20 70.46
Tools Fire Hooks Uniimited Pulaski Axe with Fiberglass Handle Each Fire Hooks Unlimited Pulaski Axe with Fiberglass PUL-AXE 72 5 68.4
Tools Akron 58" Round or Square Point Shovels, Utra-Lite Handle Each FIRE HOOKS UNLIMITED: POINTED 55" SHV-P55 66 5 62.7
Toals Akron McLeod Widland Fire Tool, 48" Wooden Handle Each COUNCIL TOOL McLeod Tool; 48 in. Wooden MT48 FSS 138.02 20 110.42
Tools Council Pick & Shove! Combi-Tool Each Council Pick & Shovel Combi-Tool CT42 FSS 17435 |20 139.48
Tools Council Tool Forest Fire Rake Each Council Tool Forest Fire Rake LW12-60 F 71.27 20 57.02
Tools Council Tool McLeod Tool Each Council Tool McLeod Tool MT48 138.02 |20 110.42
Tools Fire Hooks Unlimited Wikdiand McCloud Tool Each Fire Hooks Unlimited Wildland McCloud Tool MCLF 84 9 76.44
Toals Fire Hooks Unfimzed Brush Fire Broom, 5 Ft Length Each Fire Hooks Unlimited Brush Fire Broom, 5 Ft Length [BBR-5 22.8 i1 20,29
Toals Fire Hooks Unlimited Brush Rake, 5 foet Each Fire Hooks Unlimited Brush Rake, 5 feet BRF-35 57.6 11 51.26
Tools Council Tool Fire Swatter w/ 60" Handle Each Council Tool Fire Swatter w/ 60" Handle 158 49.45 20 39.56
Tools Nupla Single Edge Bush Hook Each NUPLA Ergo-Power Bush Hook, Double Edge 72940 103.45 30 72.42
RFP# 0900000564 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURER'S LIST PRICE

SUPPLIER NAME: Casco

EXHIBIT 3 - FIREFIGHTER'S EQUIPMENT - STATION WEAR

PRODUCT PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURER'S LIST
Shirts 15% off 5.11 and 37% off Lion
Pants 15% off 5.11 and 37% off Lion
Belts 15% off 5.11
Hats 15% off 5.11
Hat & Helmet Liner 15% off 5.11
Shoes/Boots 15% off 5.11 and 30% off Thorogood/Weinbrenner

Other items Not listed Above in Exhibit 3 Example

15% off 5.11

EXHIBIT 4 - STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTER'S EQUIPMENT

PRODUCT PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURER'S
Helmets 28% off Cairns
Hoods 30% off Majestic hoods and 17% off PGI Hoods
Gloves 30% off Veridian
Eye Protection 28% off Cairns
Boots 25% off Globe Boots
Turnout Gear - Coats 33% off Globe
Turnout Gear - Pants 33% off Globe
Tools Carried/Utilized by Firefighters in Structural 10% off Casco website
Other items Not Listed Above in Exhibit 4 Example 10% off Casco website

EXHIBIT 5 - WILDLAND FIREFIGHTER'S EQUIPMENT




PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURER'S

Boots 25% off Globe Boots

Gloves 30% off Veridian

Pants 16% off PGI and 30% off Veridian
Shirts 16% off PGI

Jumpsuits 16% off PGI and 30% off Veridian
Coats/Jackets 16% off PGI and 30% off Veridian
Helmets 22% off Bullard

Face Masks/Shrouds 28% off Carins

Goggles 28% off Carins

Firefighting Pumps 20% off Hale

Drip Torch 5% off Peco

wildland Packs 5% off Peco

Forest Fire Protection Shelter 5% off Peco

Radio Holster, Hip Case, Radio Chest Harness 8% off True North

Tools 10% off Casco website

Other items Not Listed Above in Exhibit 5 Example 10% off Casco website
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