Instructions - For each category price the job titles you support within each category, provide hourly not-to-exceed rates for each level and category as applicable.

Pricing must include travel costs

Definitions:
Level 1 - Has basic knowledge or limited experience.
Level II - Has intermediate practical application skills.

Level III - Has advanced to expert skills in application and recognition of solutions.

Example Rate Card Format

Category Title | Level I, I1 & III | Hourly Pricing

Category I Administrative Support No Bid Level | No Bid
(including office and clerical) No Bid Level Il No Bid
No Bid Level Il No Bid
. . No Bid Level | No Bid
Category II Commercial/Industrial workers No Bid Tovell No Bid
No Bid Level Il No Bid
Nurse Practioner (NP) Level | 98.04
Nurse Practioner (NP) Level Il 104.81
Nurse Practioner (NP) Level Il 115.00
Registered Nurse (RN) Level | 62.75
Registered Nurse (RN) Level Il 77.24
Registered Nurse (RN) Level Ill 94.28
Licensed Nurse Practioner (LPN) Level | 43.65
Licensed Nurse Practioner (LPN) Level Il 64.05
Licensed Nurse Practioner (LPN) Level Il 74.25
Certified Medication Aide (CMA) Level | 25.29
Category III Healthcare Staffing Services (Clinical) Certified Medication Aide (CMA) Level Il 29.65
Certified Medication Aide (CMA) Level Ill 34.45
Certified Nurse Assistant (CNA) Level | 24.29
Certified Nurse Assistant (CNA) Level Il 28.65
Certified Nurse Assistant (CNA) Level Il 32.45
Certified Medical Assistant (CMA) Level | 24.29
Certified Medical Assistant (CMA) Level Il 26.93
Certified Medical Assistant (CMA) Level Il 30.90
Phlebotomist Level | 25.69
Phlebotomist Level Il 27.93
Phlebotomist Level Ill 32.45

All Other Healthcare Positions Level I, I1, 11l Pay Rate x 1.45 = Bill Rate
Category IV Healthcare Staffing Services No Bid Level | No Bid
(Non-Clinical) No Bid Level II No Bid
No Bid Level Il No Bid
No Bid Level Il No Bid
) ) No Bid Level Ill No Bid
categ(’“('gt hl;rrotf}?;:‘l’;lfl Services No Bid Level Il No Bid
No Bid Level | No Bid
No Bid Level Il No Bid
No Bid Level IlI No Bid




