State of Oklahoma
Department of Central Services
Central Purchasing

Notice of Statewide Contract
Award

Official signed contract documents are on file with DCS-Central Purchasing.

Contract Title: MRO Plumbing Supplies
Statewide Contract #: SW817-P
Contract Issuance Date: December 8, 2011
Total Number of Vendors: 4 (For details see: Vendor Information Sheet)

Contract Period: December 8, 2011 through October 30, 2012

Agreement Period: December 8, 2011 through October 30, 2016

Authorized Users: All Authorized Users
Contract Priority: Mandatory

Type of Contract: Firm, Fixed Price. Indefinity Quantity

DCS-CP Contact: Lisa Bradley Phone: 1 - 405 - 522 - 4480
Title: Contracting Officer Fax: 1 - 405 -521 - 4475

Email: Lisa_bradley@dcs.state.ok.us

Central Purchasing - Will Rogers Office Building (2401 N. Lincoln Boulevard), Suite 116 / P.O. Box 528803 - Oklahoma City, OK 73152-8803
Telephone: 405/521-2110 - Fax: 405/521-4475 - www.dcs.ok.gov
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State of Oklahoma
Department of Central Services Awarded Vendors Information
Central Purchasing

PAGE 1 OF
Vendor Name: Central Oklahoma Winnelson Vendor ID#: 0000064988
Vendor Address:  Address: 5037 SW 10" Street
City: Oklahoma City State: OK Zip Code: 73127
Contact Person Name: Keith Jones Phone #: 1 - 405 - 947 - 8761
Title: President Fax #: 1 - 405 - 947 - 1934
Email: KRJones@winnelson.com
Website: www.centralwinnelson.com
Authorized Location: [] Locations list attached as (attachment title)
[ ] Address:
City: State: Zip Code:
Contract ID #: 0-3113
Delivery: 15 Business Days/ Standard Iltems Minimum Order: N/A
P/Card Accepted [X] Yes ] No
Other: All Authorized Users
Vendor Name: Fastenal Company Vendor ID#: 000069679
Vendor Address: Address: 2001 Theurer Blvd
City: Winona State: MN Zip Code: 55987
Contact Person Name: Chris Jilge Phone #: 1 - 405 - 708 - 0844
Title: Government State Specialist Fax #: 1 - 507 - 494 - 3120
Email: govbids@fastenal.com
Website: www.fastenal.com
Authorized Location: [] Locations listing attached as (attachment title)
[ ] Address:
City: State: Zip Code:
Contract ID #: 0-3116
Delivery: 15 Business Days/Standard Iltems Minimum Order: None
P/Card Accepted: [X] Yes ] No
Other: All Authorized Users

Central Purchasing - Will Rogers Office Building (2401 N. Lincoln Boulevard), Suite 116 / P.O. Box 528803 - Oklahoma City, OK 73152-8803

Telephone: 405/521-2110 - Fax: 405/521-4475 - www.dcs.ok.gov

DCS/PURCHASING - FORM 072D (01/2008)



State of Oklahoma
Department of Central Services
Central Purchasing

Awarded Vendors Information

Vendor Name:
Vendor Address:

Contact Person Name:

Title:
Email:
Website:

Authorized Location:

Contract ID #:
Delivery:
P/Card Accepted [X] Yes

Other:

Vendor Name:
Vendor Address:

Contact Person Name:
Title:

Email:

Website:

Authorized Location:

Contract ID #:
Delivery:

P/Card Accepted:
Other:

PAGE 2 OF

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc. Vendor ID#: 0000071355
Address: 3901 W Reno Avenue
City: Oklahoma City

Robert Smith

State: OK Zip Code: 73107
Phone #: 1 - 405 - 235 - 7354

Outside Sales Fax #: 1 - 405 - 239 - 2027

robert.smith6@ferguson.com

www.fergusononline.com

[] Locations list attached as (attachment title)
[ ] Address:

City: State: Zip Code:
0-3114
15 Business Days/ Standard Iltems

[ ] No

Minimum Order: N/A

All Authorized Users

Plumbmaster , Inc. Vendor ID#: 0000206570
Address: PO Box 850

State: PA Zip Code: 19331
Phone #: 1 -800 - 523 -5130

Fax #: 1 -800 - 259 - 3143

City: Concordville
Katie Manley
Marketing Assistang

bids@plumbmaster.com

www.plumbmaster.com

[] Locations listing attached as (attachment title)
[ ] Address:

City:
0-3115
15 Business Days/Standard Iltems
X Yes ] No
All Authorized Users

State: Zip Code:

Minimum Order: None

Central Purchasing - Will Rogers Office Building (2401 N. Lincoln Boulevard), Suite 116 / P.O. Box 528803 - Oklahoma City, OK 73152-8803

Telephone: 405/521-2110 - Fax: 405/521-4475 - www.dcs.ok.gov

DCS/PURCHASING - FORM 072D (01/2008)



State of Oklahoma

Vendor ID 0000064988

CENTRAL OKLAHOMA WINNELSON
PO BOX 75143

OKLAHOMA CITY OK 73147-0143

Tax Exenpt? Y Tax Exenpt 1D:736017987

CONTRACT

Dispatch via Print

Contract ID
0000000000000000000003113

Page
lof 1

Contract Dates
12/08/2011 to 10/30/2012 USD

Currency

Rate Type Rate Date
CRRNT PO Date

Description:
SW817-P MRO Plumbing

Contract Maximum
0.00

TYPE: STATEWIDE

Minimum Order

Maximum / Open

Line # Item ID/ltem Desc Qty Amt Qty Amt
1 1000009934 0. 00 0. 00 0. 00 0. 00
MRO: Plumbing Supplies
Contract Base Pricing 1.00000 EA 0001
COMMENTS:
Final = The price is final after adjustments Authorized Signature
Hard = Apply adjustments regardless of other adjustments . , ]
Skip = Skip adjustments if any other adjustments have been applied Orlglnal Slgnature on File



Lbradley
Typewritten Text
Original Signature on File


State of Oklahoma
MRO Plumbing Supplies
RFP # SW 817-P
Attachment A: Cost Proposal

Instructions
There are eight (8) sheets in this workbook. The first sheet is the Tier 1 listing of products. The remaining sheets
correspond to the six MRO plumbing sub-categories defined in the RFP Section C.1.

List of Sheets

1. Pipe

2. Fixtures

3. Brass

4. Pumps

5. Valves

6. Attached Plumbing Equipment

Respondents can go directly to the sheet(s) they are interested in bidding. However, Respondents are
encouraged to go through all the sheets to maximize their bid coverage. Blank cells will be considered "No
Response."

The pricing for the purposes of this RFP follows a tiered structure as defined in the RFP Section C.4. Each of the
sub-category sheet asks the Respondents to fill out four sections:

a. Tier 1 Pricing

This is the firm fixed contract pricing part. A number of most frequently purchased items are listed, and the
State expects the you to offer their most aggressive pricing in this tier. You are asked to bid on as many items as
possible. You are expected to bid on the identical items as listed by filling out the columns under "Identical
Items." However, in the event that the you do not carry the identical item but do carry a similar product, you
may be respond by filling out the columns under "Functional Equivalents." You may also fill out both Identical
Item and Functional Equivalent, if you carry the identical product but also carry a lower-priced functional
equivalent. Please keep in mind if you carry the identical item, you should include it in the response. The
quoted price will include Standard Shipping as defined in the RFP.

b. Tier 2 Pricing

A number of most popular manufacturers are listed in this section. Respondents are asked to enter a discount
off list percentage specific to as many manufacturers as possible. You are also asked to provide the source of the
list price. Additionally, there is space at the bottom to include more manufacturers for which you can offer the
State deep discounts. The price calculated after applying the quoted discount percentage to the list price will
include Standard Shipping as defined in the RFP.



State of Oklahoma

Vendor ID 0000069679
FASTENAL COMPANY INC
2001 THEURER BLVD

PO BOX 1244

WINONA MN 55987-7244

Tax Exenpt? Y Tax Exenpt 1D:736017987

CONTRACT

Dispatch via Print

Contract ID Page
0000000000000000000003116 lof 1
Contract Dates Currency Rate Type Rate Date
12/08/2011 to 10/30/2012 USD CRRNT PO Date
Description: Contract Maximum
SW817-P MRO Plumbing 0.00

TYPE: STATEWIDE

Minimum Order Maximum / Open

Line # Item ID/ltem Desc Qty Amt Qty Amt
1 1000009934 1.00 0. 00 0. 00 0. 00
MRO: Plumbing Supplies
Contract Base Pricing 0.01000 0001
COMMENTS:

Final = The price is final after adjustments
Hard = Apply adjustments regardless of other adjustments
Skip = Skip adjustments if any other adjustments have been applied

Authorized Signature

Original  Signature  on File



Lbradley
Typewritten Text
Original Signature on File


Tier 2 - Pumps

Ref #

Manufacturer

URL or Other
Publicly Available
Source of List Price

Proposed Discount Off
List Price

HB1

A.Y. McDonald

HB2

Bell & Gossett

HB3

Dayton

HB4

Goulds

HB5

Ingersoll Rand

HB6

Little Giant

Fastenal Wholesale

26%

HB7

Merrill

HB8

Stenner

HB9

Topp

HB10

Watts

Fastenal Wholesale

26%

HB11

Zoehler

Additional Manufacturer's May Be Added Here

HB12

Fastenal Wholesale

26%

HB13

Fastenal Wholesale

26%

HB14

Fastenal Wholesale

26%

HB15

HB16

HB17

HB18

HB19

HB20

HB21

HB22

HB23

HB24

HB25

HB26

HB27

HB28

HB29

HB30

HB31

HB32

HB33

HB34

HB35

HB36

HB37

HB38

HB39




HB40

HB41

HB42

HB43




Vendor # Comments

132517

132560

133526 AMT (American Machine & Tool)
131663 Hypro (Shertech, Shurflo)
136261 Flint & Walling



State of Oklahoma

Vendor ID 0000071355
FERGUSON ENTERPRISES INC
3901 W RENO AVE

OKLAHOMA CITY OK 73107-6600

Tax Exenpt? Y Tax Exenpt 1D:736017987

CONTRACT

Dispatch via Print

Contract ID Page
0000000000000000000003114 lof 1
Contract Dates Currency Rate Type Rate Date
12/08/2011 to 10/30/2012 USD CRRNT PO Date
Description: Contract Maximum
SW817-P MRO Plumbing Supplies 0.00

TYPE: STATEWIDE

Minimum Order Maximum / Open

Line # Item ID/ltem Desc Qty Amt Qty Amt
1 1000009934 1.00 0. 00 0. 00 0. 00
MRO: Plumbing Supplies
Contract Base Pricing 1.00000 EA 0003
COMMENTS:

Final = The price is final after adjustments
Hard = Apply adjustments regardless of other adjustments
Skip = Skip adjustments if any other adjustments have been applied

Authorized Signature

on File

Original Signature



Lbradley
Typewritten Text
Original Signature on File


Plumbing Supplies

Respondent's Name:

There are seven sections/categories in this sheet. Please complete all categories for which you are responding to. For detailed instructions on
how to fill out these sections, please refer to "Instructions” sheet. Only the yellow-shaded cells are to be filled by the Respondent.

ROBERT SMITH

TIER1  Fixed Contract Pricing (Inclusive of Standard Delivery)
TIER 2 Discount % off List Price by Manufacturer (Inclusive of Standard Delivery) By Single Category
IDENTICAL PRODUCT FUNCTIONAL EQUIVALENT
Historical
Ref # Manufacturer i (i Product Description uom Qty per Annual Qty [ Your Part Number Manufacturer (R (i Prm?nc.t uom Qty Per UOM List Price Contract Price | Your Part Number | Manufacturer (G (i Prm?nc-t uom Qty Per UOM List Price Contract Price
Number UOM |5 hased Number Description Number Description
TIER 1

HA1 DELTA B3596LF FAUCET, LAVATORY EA EA 171|DB3596LF DELTA B3596LF EA $176.20 $96.91 |
HA2 GERBER 21-377 PRESSURE ASSIST TOILET BOWL, 1.6 GPF EA EA 108| G21377WH GERBER 21-377 |EA $121.00 |
HA3 BEMIS 1950-000 SEAT, TOILET, OPEN FRONT EA EA 175[B1950000 BEMIS 1950-000 |£A $75.63) $41.60|PFTSCOFC2000WH [PROFLO PFTSCOFC2000WH |£A $46.23) $25.43
HA4 DELTA 2131 LAVATORY FAUCET, CHROME EA EA 101/D2131 DELTA 2131 EA $66.85) $36.77,
HAS |SPEAKMAN S-2253-E175 SHOWERHEAD, WALL MOUNT/LOW FLOW EA EA 173|S52253E175 |SPEAKMAN S-2253-E175 EA $46.00 $29.90
HA6 HALSEY-TAYLOR HAC-8FS-Q-CHILD-SS |WATER COOLER, 8 GPH, WALL MOUNT, ADA EA EA 13|HHAC8FSQADASS HALSEY-TAYLOR |HAC-8FS-Q-CHILD-SS EA $875.00 $437.50
HA7 NULINE 225-801 FAUCET, SINK, SERVICE EA EA 26
HA8 ELKAY EZS8L \WATER COOLER, 8 GPH, EA EA 12 |EEZS8L ELKAY EZS8L EA $819.00 $409.50
HA9 ZURN 26915 FAUCET, LAVATORY, SENSORY EA EA 10 (776915 ZURN 26915 EA $618.20 $309.10
HA10 AMERICAN STANDARD 3481.001.020 BOWL, TOILET, SIPHON JET EA EA 28 $177.50 $106.50
HA11 BEMIS 7850TDG-000 SEAT, TOILET, ELONGATED EA EA 49|B7850TDGO00 BEMIS 7850TDG-000 EA $57.06) $34.24 $282.50 $169.50
HA12 DELTA T13220 HANDLE, SHOWER ONLY, LEVER, CHROME EA EA 27|DT13220 DELTA T13220 |EA $79.40 $43.67,
HA13 SLOAN 3010000 FLUSHOMETER, EXPOSED CLOSET EA EA 1853010000 SLOAN 3010000 EA $184.30 $110.58
HA14 AMERICAN STANDARD 3014.001.020 BOWL, TOILET, GRAVITY FLUSH EA EA 16
HA15 DELTA 27C4842 FAUCET, LAVATORY, COMMERCIAL, 2 HOLES EA EA 8[D27C4842 DELTA 27C4842 EA $158.85 $87.37,
HA16 GERBER 12-654 SINK, WALL HUNG, VITEROUS CHINA, ADA EA EA 14
HA17 LITTLE GIANT 6ED-CIA-SFS PUMP, SUMP, 1/3 HP EA EA 35[L506125 LITTLE GIANT 6ED-CIA-SFS EA $264.80 $132.40
HA18 ZOELLER N282 PUMP, SEWAGE, 1/2 HP EA EA 8|72820002 ZOELLER N282 EA $721.00 $432.60
HA19 LITTLE GIANT [ TE-5.5-MD-HC PUMP, MAGNETIC DRIVE EA EA 5[L585604 LITTLE GIANT TE-5.5-MD-HC EA $777.00 $466.20
HA20 ZOELLER M98 PUMP, SUMP, 1/2HP, 9.4 A EA EA 8|7980044 ZOELLER M98 |EA $267.00 $186.90
HA21 LITTLE GIANT S5MSP-18 PUMP, SUMP, 1/6 HP EA EA 291505501 LITTLE GIANT 5MSP-18 EA $175.00 $122.50
HA22 LITTLE GIANT VCL-24ULS PUMP, CONDENSATE, 115V EA EA 12)1553201 LITTLE GIANT VCL-24ULS |EA $192.00 $115.20
HA23 BELL & GOSSETT 185332 SEAL BEARING ASSEMBLY EA EA 7/ 8185332 BELL & GOSSETT 185332 EA $395.00 $276.50
HA24 LITTLE GIANT EC-400 (CONDENSATE, MINI-SPLIT EA EA 11)1553455 LITTLE GIANT EC-400 EA $194.00 $106.70
HA25 MCDONNELL&MILLER FS251 SWITCH, FLOW, GENERAL PURPOSE, NEMA1 EA EA 13]
HA26 MCDONNELL&MILLER FS254 SWITCH, FLOW, GENERAL PURPOSE, NEMA4 EA EA 6]
HA27 SLOAN GS-8111 VALVE, FLUSH, 1.6 GPF EA EA 8[53250400 SLOAN GS-8111 |EA $555.15 $333.09
HA28 FLUIDMASTER PRO 45 VALVE, FILL, ANTI-SIPHON, ADJUSTABLE EA EA 126|FPRO45 FLUIDMASTER PRO 45 EA $12.14 $7.28,
HA29 APOLLO 3820406 VACUUM BREAKER EA EA 28|A3820406 APOLLO 3820406 EA $69.89 $27.96)
HA30 SLOAN 5301058 VALVE, RELIEF, CLOSET EA EA 17255301058 SLOAN 55301058 EA $6.25) $3.75,
HA31 SLOAN A19AC VALVE, RELIEF, WHITE EA EA 101{S55301058 SLOAN 55301058 EA $6.25 $3.75
HA32 APOLLO 94A20001 VALVE, BALL, 3" SOLDER, BRASS, 2 PC EA EA 9 FNW411M FNW FNW411M EA $492.33 $172.32
HA33 |SHARKBITE 22185-0000GR VALVE, BALL, 3/4", 200 PSI, BRASS EA EA 34 FNW485F FNW FNW485F EA $32.42 $11.35)
HA34 WATTS L100XL-3 VALVE, T&P, 3/4", M X F, BRONZE EA EA 50|WL100XL3M7150210F |WATTS L100XL-3 EA $13.17,
HA35 SLOAN ROYAL 180 VALVE, FLUSH, 3.5 GPF EA EA 7[53912480 SLOAN ROYAL 180 |EA $787.50 $472.50
HA36 MILWAUKEE 50911/2 VALVE, CHECK, SWING, 1-1/2", FNPT, BRONZE EA EA 7|M509) MILWAUKEE 509 1-1/2 $284.76 $113.90| FNW1241) FNW FNW1241) EA $118.88 $50.64
HA37 WHIRLPOOL E2F40RD0O45V \WATER HEATER, 40 GAL, ELECTRIC EA EA 12 SES640DORT45 STATE INDUST. |ES640DORT45 EA $614.00| $308.00
HA38 BRADFORD WHITE M-1-MH-30T6L \WATER HEATER, 30 GAL, LP GAS EA EA 58 SGS640HBRT STATE INDUST. |GS640HBRT EA $746.00 $385.00
HA39 |EMERSON SGW2607-430553 \WATER HEATER ELEMENT EA EA 65
HA40 SLOAN A38A REPAIR KIT, TOILET, 4.5 GPF EA EA 267|53301038 SLOAN A38A EA $23.15) $10.42
HA41 AMERICAN STANDARD 066501-0020A VACUUM BREAKER REPAIR KIT EA EA 277,
HA42 HARVEY 004300-24 GASKET, TOILET BOWL EA EA 749
HA43 SLOAN A156A DIAPHRAM, BLACK RUBBER EA EA 335|55301188 SLOAN A156A EA $6.25 $3.75)
HA44 HOSEMASTER GO755M240 HOSE, FLEXIBLE METAL, 3/4" DIA, 24" L EA EA 28
HA45 SLOAN A37A REPAIR KIT, URINAL, 1.5 GPF EA EA 82(53301037 SLOAN A37A EA $23.15 $10.42
HA46 SLOAN 3317003 MASTER KIT, WATER SAVER, FLUSH VALVE EA EA 45(53317003 SLOAN 3317003 EA $30.40 $13.68,
HA47 SLOAN 3317001 MASTER KIT, CLOSET, EA EA 45|53317001 SLOAN 3317001 EA $30.40 $13.68,
HA48 NIBCO 604 1 ADAPTER, 1", 1-1/8" OD, EA EA 290|CMA NIBCO 604 1 EA $5.43 $36.22,
HA49 SLOAN A1041A REPAIR KIT, DIAPHRAGM, 1.6 GPF EA EA 31{53301502 SLOAN A1041A EA $45.20 $20.34
HAS0 LEGEND 204-112 COUPLING, PVC, COMPRESSION, MATERIAL 6 EA EA 14
HAS51 BAND K MUELLER 490-302HC VALVE, INLET, 1/2 X 3/8 OD ANGLE EA EA 245,
HAS52 SLOAN 5301188 DIAPHRAGM, MANUAL FLUSH VALVE EA EA 19955301188 SLOAN 5301188 EA $6.25) $3.75)
HAS53 BAND K MUELLER 491-302HC STOP, SUPPLY, QUARTER TURN, INLET 1/2" EA EA 112
HA54 NIBCO U60711/2 ELBOW, 90 DEG, 1/2", COPPER EA EA 445|CoD NIBCO U60711/2 EA $3.99 $0.66,
HAS5 SLOAN 3012600 FLUSHMETER, EXPOSED, URINAL, 1.5 GPF EA EA 1653012600 SLOAN 3012600 EA $184.30 $110.58|
HAS6 AMERICAN STANDARD 4021.128.020 TANK, TOILET, 1.28 GPF, WHITE EA EA 7|
HAS7 HARVEY 011003 GASKET, WAX RING, 3 AND 4" WASTE LINE EA EA 231
HAS8 GERBER 28-590 TANK, TOILET, GRAVITY FLUSH, 1.28 GPF, WHITE EA EA 7|
HAS9 AMERICAN STANDARD 4800.3724.002 FAUCET, LAVATORY, 2 HANDLE, 1.5 GPM, CHROME EA EA 10| PFLL1012ML PROFLO PFLL1012ML |EA $45.26 $28.88)
HA60 NONE NONE PIPE, TYPE L, 1', COPPER, 10 FT FT 10 37|LHARDG20 MUELLER FT. $4.07,
HA61 NONE NONE PIPE, TYPE M, 1 1/4" COPPER, 10 FT FT 10 30[MHARDH20 MUELLER FT $4.65
HA62 NONE NONE PIPE, TYPE L, 1/2", COPPER, 10 FT FT 10 62| LHARDD20 MUELLER FT $1.66,
HA63 NONE NONE PIPE, TYPE L, 2", COPPER, 10 FT FT 10 8[LHARDK20 MUELLER FT $11.82
HA64 NONE NONE PIPE, PVC, SCHEDULE 40, 1", PRICED PER FOOT FT FT S#P4OBEPGZO CHARLOTTE FT $0.53,
HAB5 NONE NONE PIPE, PVC, SCHEDULE 40, 2", PRICED PER FOOT FT FT 37|P40PK20 |CHARLOTTE FT $0.77,
HA66 NONE NONE PIPE, BLACK STEEL, 2", THREADED, 10 FT FT FT 157|DBPTCA53BK |\MPDRT FT $2.88)




State of Oklahoma

Vendor ID 0000206570
PLUMBMASTER INC

PO BOX 850

51 LA CRUE AVE
CONCORDVILLE PA 19331-0700

Tax Exenpt? Y Tax Exenpt 1D:736017987

CONTRACT

Dispatch via Print

Contract ID Page
0000000000000000000003115 lof 1
Contract Dates Currency Rate Type Rate Date
12/08/2011 to 10/30/2012 USD CRRNT PO Date
Description: Contract Maximum
SW817-P MRO Plumbing Supplies 0.00

TYPE: STATEWIDE

Minimum Order Maximum / Open

Line # Item ID/ltem Desc Qty Amt Qty Amt
1 1000009934 1.00 0. 00 0. 00 0. 00
MRO: Plumbing Supplies
Contract Base Pricing 1.00000 EA 0001
COMMENTS:

Final = The price is final after adjustments
Hard = Apply adjustments regardless of other adjustments
Skip = Skip adjustments if any other adjustments have been applied

Authorized Signature

Original Signature on File



Lbradley
Typewritten Text
Original Signature on File


Plumbing Supplies

Respondent's Name:

There are seven sections/categories in this sheet. Please complete all categories for which you are responding to. For detailed instructions on
how to fill out these sections, please refer to "Instructions" sheet. Only the yellow-shaded cells are to be filled by the Respondent.

TIER 1 Fixed Contract Pricing (Inclusive of Standard Delivery)
TIER 2 Discount % off List Price by Manufacturer (Inclusive of Standard Delivery) By Single Category
IDENTICAL PRODUCT FUNCTIONAL EQUIVALENT
Manufacturer Part ) Qty per Historical Your Part er Part ey . . . Your Part Manufacturer Product a q
Ref # Manufacturer Product Description uom Annual Qty er Product Description UOM | Qty Per UOM List Price| Contract Price Manufacturer o uom Qty Per UOM List Price
Number uom Number Number Number Part Number Description
Purchased
TIER1

HA1 DELTA B3596LF FAUCET, LAVATORY EA EA 171 95001|DELTA B3596LF FAUCET, LAVATORY EA 1 $176.20 $121.12
HA2 GERBER 21-377 PRESSURE ASSIST TOILET BOWL, 1.6 GPF EA EA 108 95001 |GERBER 21-377 PRESSURE ASSIST TOILET BOWL, 1.6 GPF EA 1 $242.00 $151.25
HA3 BEMIS 1950-000 SEAT, TOILET, OPEN FRONT EA EA 175 41178|BEMIS 1950-000 SEAT, TOILET, OPEN FRONT EA 1 $75.63 $44.24
HA4 DELTA 2131 LAVATORY FAUCET, CHROME EA EA 101 95001|DELTA 2131 LAVATORY FAUCET, CHROME EA 1 $66.85 $45.95
HAS SPEAKMAN $-2253-E175 SHOWERHEAD, WALL MOUNT/LOW FLOW EA EA 173 95001 [SPEAKMAN $-2253-E175 SHOWERHEAD, WALL MOUNT/LOW FLOW EA 8 $46.00 $31.05
HA6 HALSEY-TAYLOR HAC-8FS-Q-CHILD-SS |WATER COOLER, 8 GPH, WALL MOUNT, ADA EA EA 13 32642 |HALSEY-TAYLOR HAC-8FS-Q-CHILD-SS WATER COOLER, 8 GPH, WALL MOUNT, ADA EA 1 $925.00 $479.00
HA7 NULINE 225-801 FAUCET, SINK, SERVICE EA EA 26 95001 |NULINE 225-801 FAUCET, SINK, SERVICE EA 1 $186.61 $163.47
HA8 ELKAY EZS8L WATER COOLER, 8 GPH, EA EA 12 95001 |ELKAY EZS8L WATER COOLER, 8 GPH, EA 1 $819.00 $393.75
HA9 ZURN 26915 FAUCET, LAVATORY, SENSORY EA EA 10 71931|ZURN 26915 FAUCET, LAVATORY, SENSORY EA 1 $618.20 $310.50
HA10 AMERICAN STANDARD 3481.001.020 BOWL, TOILET, SIPHON JET EA EA 28 95001 |AMERICAN STANDARD 3481.001.020 BOWL, TOILET, SIPHON JET EA 1 $167.00 $114.79
HA11 BEMIS 7850TDG-000 SEAT, TOILET, ELONGATED EA EA 49 95001|BEMIS 7850TDG-000 SEAT, TOILET, ELONGATED Cs 6 $57.00 $33.68
HA12 DELTA T13220 HANDLE, SHOWER ONLY, LEVER, CHROME EA EA 27, 95001|DELTA T13220 HANDLE, SHOWER ONLY, LEVER, CHROME EA 1 $123.65 $45.58
HA13 SLOAN 3010000 FLUSHOMETER, EXPOSED CLOSET EA EA 18, 98960|SLOAN 3010000 FLUSHOMETER, EXPOSED CLOSET EA 1 $184.30 $109.43
HA14 AMERICAN STANDARD 3014.001.020 BOWL, TOILET, GRAVITY FLUSH EA EA 16, 95001 |AMERICAN STANDARD 3014.001.020 BOWL, TOILET, GRAVITY FLUSH EA 1 $193.00 $132.66
HA15 DELTA 27C4842 FAUCET, LAVATORY, COMMERCIAL, 2 HOLES EA EA 8 95001|DELTA 27C4842 FAUCET, LAVATORY, COMMERCIAL, 2 HOLES EA 1 $158.85 $105.45
HAl6 GERBER 12-654 SINK, WALL HUNG, VITEROUS CHINA, ADA EA EA 14 95001 |GERBER 12-654 SINK, WALL HUNG, VITEROUS CHINA, ADA EA 1 $99.00 $61.88
HA17 LITTLE GIANT 6ED-CIA-SFS PUMP, SUMP, 1/3 HP EA EA 35 95001 |LITTLE GIANT 6E-CIA-SFS PUMP, SUMP, 1/3 HP EA 1 $183.68 $172.20
HA18 ZOELLER N282 PUMP, SEWAGE, 1/2 HP EA EA 8 95001 |ZOELLER N282 PUMP, SEWAGE, 1/2 HP EA 1 $809.00 $599.00
HA19 LITTLE GIANT TE-5.5-MD-HC PUMP, MAGNETIC DRIVE EA EA 5 95001 |LITTLE GIANT TE-5.5-MD-HC PUMP, MAGNETIC DRIVE EA 1 $726.77 $635.93
HA20 ZOELLER M98 PUMP, SUMP, 1/2HP, 9.4 A EA EA 8 95001 |ZOELLER M98 PUMP, SUMP, 1/2HP, 9.4 A EA 1 $299.00 $249.00
HA21 LITTLE GIANT 5MSP-18 PUMP, SUMP, 1/6 HP EA EA 29, 95001 |LITTLE GIANT 5MSP-18 PUMP, SUMP, 1/6 HP EA 1 $129.51 $113.33
HA22 LITTLE GIANT VCL-24ULS PUMP, CONDENSATE, 115V EA EA 12 95001 |LITTLE GIANT VCL-24ULS PUMP, CONDENSATE, 115V EA 1 $127.18 $111.29
HA23 BELL & GOSSETT 185332 SEAL BEARING ASSEMBLY EA EA 7 95001 |BELL & GOSSETT 185332 SEAL BEARING ASSEMBLY EA 1 $420.00 $336.00
HA24 LITTLE GIANT EC-400 CONDENSATE, MINI-SPLIT 115V EA EA 11 95001 |LITTLE GIANT EC-400 CONDENSATE, MINI-SPLIT 115V EA 1 $138.55 $112.58
HA25 MCDONNELL&MILLER FS251 SWITCH, FLOW, GENERAL PURPOSE, NEMA1 EA EA 13 95001|MCDONNELL&MILLER FS251 SWITCH, FLOW, GENERAL PURPOSE, NEMA1 EA 1 $130.00 $109.44
HA26 MCDONNELL&MILLER FS254 SWITCH, FLOW, GENERAL PURPOSE, NEMA4 EA EA 6 95001|MCDONNELL&MILLER FS254 SWITCH, FLOW, GENERAL PURPOSE, NEMA4 EA 1 $175.00 $133.41
HA27 SLOAN GS-8111 VALVE, FLUSH, 1.6 GPF EA EA 8 71055[SLOAN GS-8111 VALVE, FLUSH, 1.6 GPF EA 1 $555.15 $329.63
HA28 FLUIDMASTER PRO 45 VALVE, FILL, ANTI-SIPHON, ADJUSTABLE EA EA 126 40287|FLUIDMASTER PRO 45 VALVE, FILL, ANTI-SIPHON, ADJUSTABLE EA 1 No list price available $6.50
HA29 APOLLO 3820406 VACUUM BREAKER EA EA 28, 95001|APOLLO 3820406 VACUUM BREAKER EA 1 $59.25 $43.69
HA30 SLOAN 5301058 VALVE, RELIEF, CLOSET EA EA 172 70619|SLOAN 5301058 VALVE, RELIEF, CLOSET EA 1 $6.25 $2.26
HA31 SLOAN A19AC VALVE, RELIEF, WHITE EA EA 101 70619|SLOAN A19AC VALVE, RELIEF, WHITE EA 1 $6.25 $2.26
HA32 APOLLO 94A20001 VALVE, BALL, 3" SOLDER, BRASS, 2 PC EA EA 9 95001 |APOLLO 94A20001 VALVE, BALL, 3" SOLDER, BRASS, 2 PC EA 1 $618.00 $82.99
HA33 SHARKBITE 22185-0000GR VALVE, BALL, 3/4", 200 PSI, BRASS EA EA 34 95001 |SHARKBITE 22185-0000GR VALVE, BALL, 3/4", 200 PSI, BRASS CS 12 $9.83 $4.43
HA34 WATTS L100XL-3 VALVE, T&P, 3/4", M X F, BRONZE EA EA 50 95001 |WATTS L100XL-3 VALVE, T&P, 3/4", M X F, BRONZE EA 5 $40.35 $14.90
HA35 SLOAN ROYAL 180 VALVE, FLUSH, 3.5 GPF EA EA 7 71081[SLOAN ROYAL 180 VALVE, FLUSH, 3.5 GPF EA 1 $184.30 $109.43
HA36 MILWAUKEE 50911/2 VALVE, CHECK, SWING, 1-1/2", FNPT, BRONZE EA EA 7 95001 |MILWAUKEE 50911/2 VALVE, CHECK, SWING, 1-1/2", FNPT, BRONZE EA 1 $299.74 $164.86
HA37 WHIRLPOOL E2F40RD045V WATER HEATER, 40 GAL, ELECTRIC EA EA 12 95001 |WHIRLPOOL E2F40RD045V WATER HEATER, 40 GAL, ELECTRIC EA 1 No Bid No Bid
HA38 BRADFORD WHITE M-1-MH-30T6L WATER HEATER, 30 GAL, LP GAS EA EA 58 95001 |BRADFORD WHITE M-1-MH-30T6L WATER HEATER, 30 GAL, LP GAS EA 1 No Bid No Bid
HA39 EMERSON SGW2607-430553 WATER HEATER ELEMENT EA EA 65, 95001 |EMERSON SGW2607-430553 WATER HEATER ELEMENT EA 1 No list price available $54.28
HA40 SLOAN A38A REPAIR KIT, TOILET, 4.5 GPF EA EA 267, 70973|SLOAN A38A REPAIR KIT, TOILET, 4.5 GPF EA 1 $23.15 $8.39
HA41 AMERICAN STANDARD 066501-0020A VACUUM BREAKER REPAIR KIT EA EA 277, 41000{AMERICAN STANDARD 066501-0020A VACUUM BREAKER REPAIR KIT EA 1 $15.00 $10.80
HA42 HARVEY 004300-24 GASKET, TOILET BOWL EA EA 749 95001 |HARVEY 004300-24 GASKET, TOILET BOWL CS 24 No list price available $5.00
HA43 SLOAN A156A DIAPHRAM, BLACK RUBBER EA EA 335 70629|SLOAN A156A DIAPHRAM, BLACK RUBBER EA 1 $6.25 $3.07
HA44 HOSEMASTER GO755M240 HOSE, FLEXIBLE METAL, 3/4" DIA, 24" L EA EA 28 95001 |HOSEMASTER G0755M240 HOSE, FLEXIBLE METAL, 3/4" DIA, 24" L EA 1 No list price available $83.88
HA45 SLOAN A37A REPAIR KIT, URINAL, 1.5 GPF EA EA 82 70780[SLOAN A37A REPAIR KIT, URINAL, 1.5 GPF EA 1 $23.15 $8.39
HA46 SLOAN 3317003 MASTER KIT, WATER SAVER, FLUSH VALVE EA EA 45 70558|SLOAN 3317003 MASTER KIT, WATER SAVER, FLUSH VALVE EA 1 $30.40 $10.49
HA47 SLOAN 3317001 MASTER KIT, CLOSET, EA EA 45| 70559|SLOAN 3317001 MASTER KIT, CLOSET, EA 1 $30.40 $12.15
HA48 NIBCO 604 1 ADAPTER, 1", 1-1/8" OD, EA EA 290 97979|NIBCO 604 1 ADAPTER, 1", 1-1/8" OD, EA 1 $33.25 $7.70
HA49 SLOAN A1041A REPAIR KIT, DIAPHRAGM, 1.6 GPF EA EA 31 70476{SLOAN A1041A REPAIR KIT, DIAPHRAGM, 1.6 GPF EA 1 $42.50 $11.43
HA50 LEGEND 204-112 COUPLING, PVC, COMPRESSION, MATERIAL 6 EA EA 14 95001|LEGEND 204-112 COUPLING, PVC, COMPRESSION, MATERIAL 6 EA 8 $67.41 $30.34
HA51 BAND K MUELLER 490-302HC VALVE, INLET, 1/2 X 3/8 OD ANGLE EA EA 245 95001 |BAND K MUELLER 490-302HC VALVE, INLET, 1/2 X 3/8 OD ANGLE CS 25 $5.35 $2.54
HAS52 SLOAN 5301188 DIAPHRAGM, MANUAL FLUSH VALVE EA EA 199 70629|SLOAN 5301188 DIAPHRAGM, MANUAL FLUSH VALVE EA 1 $6.25 $3.07
HAS3 BAND K MUELLER 491-302HC STOP, SUPPLY, QUARTER TURN, INLET 1/2" EA EA 112 95001 |BAND K MUELLER 491-302HC STOP, SUPPLY, QUARTER TURN, INLET 1/2" [ 25 $5.30 $2.51
HA54 NIBCO U60711/2 ELBOW, 90 DEG, 1/2", COPPER EA EA 445 52133|NIBCO U60711/2 ELBOW, 90 DEG, 1/2", COPPER EA 1 $7.45 $0.35
HAS5 SLOAN 3012600 FLUSHMETER, EXPOSED, URINAL, 1.5 GPF EA EA 16, 70954[SLOAN 3012600 FLUSHMETER, EXPOSED, URINAL, 1.5 GPF EA 1 $184.30 $109.44
HAS56 AMERICAN STANDARD 4021.128.020 TANK, TOILET, 1.28 GPF, WHITE EA EA 7 95001 |AMERICAN STANDARD 4021.128.020 TANK, TOILET, 1.28 GPF, WHITE EA 1 $97.00 $66.68
HA57 HARVEY 011003 GASKET, WAX RING, 3 AND 4" WASTE LINE EA EA 231 95001 |HARVEY 01100 5 GASKET, WAX RING, 3 AND 4" WASTE LINE CS 24 No list price available $2.28
HA58 GERBER 28-590 TANK, TOILET, GRAVITY FLUSH, 1.28 GPF, WHITE EA EA 7 95001 |GERBER 28-590 TANK, TOILET, GRAVITY FLUSH, 1.28 GPF, WHITE EA 8 $67.00 $41.88
HA59 AMERICAN STANDARD 4800.3724.002 FAUCET, LAVATORY, 2 HANDLE, 1.5 GPM, CHROME EA EA 10, 95001 |AMERICAN STANDARD 4800.3724.002 FAUCET, LAVATORY, 2 HANDLE, 1.5 GPM, CHROME EA 1 No Bid No Bid
HA60 NONE NONE PIPE, TYPE L, 1', COPPER, 10 FT FT 10 37 95001 |William Betz Jr Inc NONE PIPE, TYPE L, 1', COPPER, 10 FT EA 1 N/A due to market variability, $50.58
HA61 NONE NONE PIPE, TYPE M, 1 1/4" COPPER, 10 FT FT 10 30 95001 |William Betz Jr Inc NONE PIPE, TYPE M, 1 1/4" COPPER, 10 FT EA 1 N/A due to market variability, $59.33
HA62 NONE NONE PIPE, TYPE L, 1/2", COPPER, 10 FT FT 10 62 95001 |William Betz Jr Inc NONE PIPE, TYPE L, 1/2", COPPER, 10 FT EA 1 N/A due to market variability, $19.66
HA63 NONE NONE PIPE, TYPE L, 2", COPPER, 10 FT FT 10 8 95001 |William Betz Jr Inc NONE PIPE, TYPE L, 2", COPPER, 10 FT EA 1 N/A due to market variability, $135.94
HAG4 NONE NONE PIPE, PVC, SCHEDULE 40, 1", PRICED PER FOOT FT FT 64 95001 |William Betz Jr Inc NONE PIPE, PVC, SCHEDULE 40, 1", PRICED PER FOOT EA 20 N/A due to market variability, $0.60
HA65 NONE NONE PIPE, PVC, SCHEDULE 40, 2", PRICED PER FOOT FT FT 37 95001 |William Betz Jr Inc NONE PIPE, PVC, SCHEDULE 40, 2", PRICED PER FOOT EA 20 N/A due to market variability, $0.80
HA66 NONE NONE PIPE, BLACK STEEL, 2", THREADED, 10 FT FT FT 157 95001 |William Betz Jr Inc NONE PIPE, BLACK STEEL, 2", THREADED, 10 FT EA 1 N/A due to market variability, $69.09
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