
 

State of Oklahoma 
Office of Management and 
Enterprise Services 
Central Purchasing 

Statewide Contract Addendum 

 
This addendum is added to and is to be considered part of the subject contract. 

 

Contract Issuance Date:  2-5-2014 

   Statewide Contract #: SW024 WSCA 

   Contract Title: Tires, Tubes and Services 

   Addendum Date: 04- 09-2014 

   Addendum #: Three (3) 
 
 
Bridgestone Americas Tire Operations, LLC has completed a participating addendum with the State of 
Oklahoma and are hereby added to the contract per this contract addendum.  
 
 
The following suppliers have been added as an authorized dealer of Bridgestone Americas Tire. 
 
Fred’s Tire & Battery LLC, Shawnee, OK 
Kiamichi Tire RT Inc, Antlers, OK 
Ralph & Sons Tire Center, Chickasha, OK 
 
  
The Authorized Dealers Spreadsheet has been updated on the website.  
 
 
WSCA has issued their addendum #2 which approved the price list for all three suppliers for the period of April 1, 2014 
through March 31, 2015.  A copy of the addendums is enclosed for references and the approved price lists are listed on 
the website. 
 
 
 
 
If you have any questions concerning the addendum contact the contracting officer below.  
Theresa Johnson, Contracting Officer  
Telephone #: (405) 521-2289  
Fax #: (405) 522-1077 
theresa.johnson@omes.ok.gov 
  

Central Purchasing · Will Rogers Office Building · 2401 N. Lincoln Boulevard, Suite 116 · Oklahoma City, OK 73105 
Telephone: 405/521-2110 · Fax: 405/521-4475 · www.omes.ok.gov 
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State of Oklahoma 
Office of Management & Enterprise 
Services 
Central Purchasing Division 

Awarded Vendor Information 

 
 

PAGE 1 OF    

Vendor Name: Bridgestone Americas Tire Operations, LLC 

Vendor Address: Address: 525 Marriot Drive 

 City: NASHVILLE State: TN Zip Code:  37214-0991 

Contact Person Name: Vicky Dunbar Phone #: 1-615-937-3693 

Title: Manager, Government Sales Fax #: 1-615-493-0000 

Email: dunbarvicky@bfusa.com 

Website:       

Authorized Location:   Locations list attached as (attachment title) 

   Address:       

 City:       State:      Zip Code:        

Contract ID #: Use Authorized Dealers – See listing of Approved Authorized Dealers 

Delivery:  As Specified Minimum Order: N/A 

P/Card Accepted:  X  Yes   No 

Other: State Purchase cards and Fleet Fuel Cards must be used by State Agencies to pay the 
authorized dealer listed herein for these Tire and Tire Services.  The State will no longer issue 
contracts directly to the authorized dealers.  

 

Central Purchasing · Will Rogers Office Building (2401 N. Lincoln Boulevard), Suite 116 / P.O. Box 528803 · Oklahoma City, OK 73152-8803 
Telephone: 405/521-2110 · Fax: 405/522-1077 · www.omes.ok.gov 
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WSCA Tires, Tubes and Service Solicitation 

ATTACHMENT C 

Pricing Discounts & Service Pricing 

Contract # MA210 Ref: Utah Bid RT12002 

Bidder Name __Bridgestone Americas Tire Operations,  LLC____________ 

 
Tires and Tubes Subcategory 

Discount on Products 
 

 Percent 
Discount 

MPL Name MPL 
Date 

MPL REF. 
Number 

1. Pursuit and Performance Tires 20% 1/1/2012 Confidential 
Government Catalog 

1/1/12  

2. Automobile/Passenger Vehicles 
3. Light Duty Trucks:  

 

20% 
20% 

1/1/2012 Confidential 
Government Catalog 

  

3a. Radial 
 

20%  
 

1/1/2012 Confidential 
Government Catalog 

1/1/12  

               3b. Bias 20%    
4. Medium Commercial/Heavy Duty 

Trucks/Buses 
BS 25%  
 FS 30% 

1/1/2012 Confidential 
Government Catalog 

1/1/12  

5. Off Road     
               5a.  Off Road Radial 
 

20% 
 

1/1/2012 Confidential 
Government Catalog 

1/1/12  

               5b. Off Road Bias 20% 
 

1/1/2012 Confidential 
Government Catalog 

1/1/12  

6. Agriculture/Farm 
 

15% 1/1/2012 Confidential 
Government Catalog 

1/1/12  

7. Industrial Tires  15% 1/1/2012 Confidential 
Government Catalog 

1/1/12  

8. Specialty Tires N/A No Bid No Bid  
 

 

  WSCA Pricing for Services 
 Product 

Sub-
Category 
1,2 & 3 

Product Sub-
Category #4: 
Medium 
Commercial 
Single      Duel 

Product Sub-
Category # 5 Off 
Road 

Product Sub-
Category #6 
Agriculture/Farm 

Product 
Sub-
Category 
#7 
Industrial 

Product sub-
Category #8  
Specialty 

1. * Tire 
Installation 
w/purchase in 
store includes 

3.00 LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 



dismount of 
used tires and 
tubes (per tire) 

2. *Change tire, 
dismount and 
mount 
 

7.00 LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 

3. *Flat Repair, 
remove, repair 
and mount 

13.00 LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 

4. *Flat repair, off 
vehicle 

10.00 LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 

5. *Rotate 
mounted tires 
(per tire) 

3.50 LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 

6. *New valve 
stem rubber or 
metal (per tire) 

3.00 LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 

7. *Wheel 
balance-
computer spin 
balance (Per 
Tire) 

9.50 LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 

8. *Wheel 
balance/Valve 
stem combo 
(per tire) 

12.50 LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 

9. Alignment 
services 

 LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 

              9a.  Standard two   
              wheel alignment                                  

70.00 LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 

             9b. Four wheel                                 
             alignment 

70.00 LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 

             9c. Bushing/cam    
              alignment 

LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 

             9d. Parts discount  
              % from list Prices 

 LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 

10. Emergency tire 
repair-road side 
assistance (per 
hour) 

LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 

11. Studding (per 
tire) 

15.00 LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 

12. Siping (per tire) LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 
13. Used tire 

recycle/disposa
l fee (per tire) 

3.00 LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 

14. Bulk tire 
disposal (min. 
of six tons 
capacity) 

LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 

15. *‘Tire pressure 
monitoring kit 
(per Tire) 
 

8.00 LCP LCP LCP LCP LCP No Bid 

 









PARTICIPATING ADDENDUM 
[hereinafter "Addendum"] 

WESTERN STATES CONTRACTING ALLIANCE 
Tires, Tubes and Services 
Utah Contract # MA210 

Between 
BRIDGESTONE AMERICAS TIRE OPERATIONS, LLC 

[hereinafter "Contractor"] 
And 

 
State of Oklahoma 

[hereinafter "Participating State" or "Participating" Entity (if not a state)] 
Participating State Contract Number: SW14024  

 
1. Scope: This Addendum will add the above Participating State (or Participating Entity) to purchase from the WSCA Contract for 
Tires, Tubes and Related Services lead by the State of Utah for use by state agencies and other entities located in the Participating 
State authorized by that state's statutes to utilize state contracts. 
 
2. Changes: The following terms and conditions will be added to the Participating Addendum for the Participating State: 

Applicable Rule:  This addendum shall be subject to the Oklahoma Central Purchasing Act, Central Purchasing Rules, and other 
statutory regulations as applicable, the Master Agreement and attachments thereto,, solicitation specifications, required certification 
statement, and all other terms and conditions listed or attached herein.  —all of which are made part of this addendum. 
 
Addendum Subject to Public Disclosure:  Unless otherwise specified in the Oklahoma Open Records Act, Central Purchasing Act, or 
other applicable law, documents and information a supplier submits as part of or in connection with  are public records and subject to 
disclosure. Suppliers claiming any portion of this addendum  as proprietary or confidential must specifically identify what documents 
or portions of documents they consider confidential and identify applicable law supporting their claim of confidentiality. The State 
Purchasing Director shall make the final decision as to whether the documentation or information is confidential pursuant to 74 O.S. 
§85.10. 
 
Legal Contract: The Contract resulting from this addendum will consist of the following documents in order of preference: (1)  this 
Addendum; and (2) the Master Agreement and any attachments thereto to the extent that it does not conflict with applicable law.  .  In 
the event there is a conflict between any of the preceding documents, this Addendum shall prevail over the Master Agreement.  
 
Non-Appropriation Clause:  The terms of any Contract resulting from the solicitation and any Purchase Order issued for multiple 
years under the Contract are contingent upon sufficient appropriations being made by the Legislature or other appropriate government 
entity. Notwithstanding any language to the contrary in the solicitation, purchase order, or any other Contract document, the 
procuring agency may terminate its obligations under the Contract if sufficient appropriations are not made by the Legislature or 
other appropriate governing entity to pay amounts due for multiple year agreements. The Requesting (procuring) Agency’s decisions 
as to whether sufficient appropriations are available shall be accepted by the supplier and shall be final and binding. 

Electronic and Information Technology Accessibility:  Pursuant to Title 74, Section 85.7d and OAC 580:15-6-21 
electronic and information technology procurements, solicitations, agreements, and contracts shall comply with 
applicable Oklahoma Information Technology Accessibility Standards issued by the Office of Management and 
Enterprise Services.  EIT Standards may be found at www.ok.gov/DCS/Central_Purchasing/index.html  or 
http://www.ok.gov/OSF/documents/isd_itas.doc. 

 
Tax Exemption 
State agency acquisitions are exempt from sales taxes and federal excise taxes.  
 
Audit and Records Clause 
1. As used in this clause, “records" includes books, documents, accounting procedures and practices, and other  data, regardless of 

http://www.ok.gov/DCS/Central_Purchasing/index.html
http://www.ok.gov/OSF/documents/isd_itas.doc


type and regardless of whether such items are in written form, in the form of computer data, or in any other form. In accepting any 
Contract with the State, the successful bidder(s) agree any pertinent State or Federal agency will have the right to examine and audit 
all records relevant to execution and performance of the resultant Contract upon 30 days’ notice, during Contractor’s regular 
business hours. 
2. The successful bidder(s) awarded the Contract(s) is required to retain records relative to the Contract for the duration of the 
Contract term and for a period of seven (7) years following completion and/or termination of the Acquisition.. If an audit, litigation, 
or other action involving such records is started before the end of the seven (7) year period, the records are required to be maintained 
for two (2) years from the date that all issues arising out of the action are resolved, or until the end of the seven (7) year retention 
period, whichever is later. 
 
 Choice of Law 
Any claims, disputes, or litigation relating to the solicitation, or the execution, interpretation, performance, or enforcement of the 
Contract shall be governed by the laws of the State of Oklahoma. 
 
Choice of Venue 
Venue for any action, claim, dispute or litigation relating in any way to the Contract shall be in Oklahoma County, Oklahoma. 
 
 Termination for Cause 
1. The supplier may terminate the Contract for default or other just cause with a 30-day written request. The State may terminate the 
Contract for default or any other just cause upon a 30-day written notification to the supplier. 
2. The State may terminate the Contract immediately, without a 30-day written notice to the supplier, when violations are found to be 
an impediment to the function of an agency and detrimental to its cause, when conditions preclude the 30-day notice, or when the 
State Purchasing Director determines that an administrative error occurred prior to Contract performance. 
3. If the Contract is terminated by reason of nonpayment by the State, the State shall be liable only for payment for products and/or 
services delivered and accepted. 
 
Termination for Convenience 
1. The State may terminate the Contract, in whole or in part, for convenience if the State Purchasing Director determines that 
termination is in the State's best interest. The State Purchasing Director shall terminate the Contract by delivering to the supplier a 
Notice of Termination for Convenience specifying the terms and effective date of Contract termination.  The Contract termination 
date shall be a minimum of 60 days from the date the Notice of Termination for Convenience is issued by the State Purchasing 
Director. 
2.  The State’s sole liability for termination shall be for products and/or services delivered and accepted, and for costs and expenses 
(exclusive of profit) reasonably incurred and connected with those products and services delivered and accepted, prior to the date 
upon which the Notice of Termination for Convenience was received by the supplier. 
 
Insurance 
The supplier awarded the Contract shall obtain and retain insurance, including workers' compensation, and general liability, as 
required by the Master Agreement, or as required by State or Federal law, prior to commencement of any work in connection with 
the Contract. The supplier awarded the Contract shall timely renew the policies to be carried pursuant to this section throughout the 
term of the Contract and shall provide the Central Purchasing Division and the procuring agency with evidence of such insurance and 
renewals upon request.  The State can terminate the agreement immediately upon notice that the supplier has no insurance or fails to 
provide proof upon request.  
 
Employment Relationship 
The Contract does not create an employment relationship. Individuals performing services required by this Contract are not 
employees of the State of Oklahoma or the procuring agency. The supplier's employees shall not be considered employees of the 
State of Oklahoma nor of the procuring agency for any purpose, and accordingly shall not be eligible for rights or benefits accruing to 
state employees.   
 
Compliance with the Oklahoma Taxpayer and Citizen Protection Act of 2007:  OMITTED FROM THIS DOCUMENT AND 
ADDED TO THE DEALER AGREEMENT.   
 
Compliance with Applicable Laws:  OMITTED FROM THIS DOCUMENT AND ADDED TO THE DEALER AGREEMENT. 
 
 



Authorized Users. 
The Participating Addendum shall cover requirements during the specified period for all State Departments, Boards, Commissions, 
Agencies and Institutions.  The Oklahoma Statutes state that Counties, School Districts and Municipalities may avail themselves of 
the contract subject to the approval of the successful bidder(s). 
 
 X Yes, permits usage by other than State Agencies 
 
 ______ No,  permits usage by State Agencies only. 
 
State Purchasing Card. 
Vendors Please Note – In order to be considered for award.  Successful supplier must accept the State of Oklahoma Purchase Card 
(P-CARD) and State of Oklahoma Fleet Fuel Card.  Failure to accept the P-Card May be cause for rejection of your response.  
 
Contract Usage Report Requirements. 
Reports shall provide line item description and pricing along with total dollar amounts sold to all political entities that include but are  
not limited to State Agencies, Counties, Cities, Schools, Hospitals, and Municipalities. 
 
Reports shall be submitted quarterly regardless of quantity. 
 
 Usage Reports shall be submitted in Excel format and shall be delivered to Central Purchasing within 30 calendar days upon 
completion of performance quarter period cited.  Usage Reports may be delivered via the following addresses: 
 
Email – strategic.sourcing@omes.ok.gov   
 
Physical Address: 
Will Rogers Building 
2401 N. Lincoln, Suite 116 
Oklahoma City, Ok 73105 
 
 
Contract Quarterly reporting periods shall be: 
 
  January 1 through March 31 
  April 1 through June 30 
  July 1 through September 30 
  October 1 through December 31  
 
Failure to provide usage reports shall result in cancellation or suspension of contract. 
Usage Reports shall be submitted in the Excel format, in CP-92 form available on OMES website.  
 
B.26.     Contract  Management Fees 
As empowered by State Statute 74 O.S.§85.33 A & B, the Office of Management and Enterprise Services imposes, and Vendors 
agree to pay a contract management fee in the sum of one half of one percent (1/2)% of the combined total quarterly expenditures 
under this contract. This contract management fee is to be noted on the quarterly “Contract Usage Report” and paid by the Vendor, to 
OMES, Central Purchasing Division within 30 calendar days from the completion of the quarterly reporting period stated under the 
section titled “Contract Usage Reporting”. 

The Contract Management Fee is not to be considered an add-on fee to the agency, but is to be included within the cost and discount 
percentage provided with the bidders response to this solicitation. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
To ensure the payment is credited properly, the supplier must identify the check as a “Contract Management Fee” and include the 
following information with the payment:  SW Contract number and Title, the report amount and the reporting period covered.  The 

mailto:strategic.sourcing@omes.ok.gov


Contract Management Fee shall be mailed to: 

OMES – Central Purchasing Division 

Agency Business Services  

3812 N. Santa Fe, Suite 290 

Oklahoma City, OK 73118-8500 
 
 
3. Primary Contact: The primary Participating State contact individual for this participating addendum is as follows:  

Name: Theresa Johnson   
Participating Entity: State of Oklahoma 
Address: 2401 N. Lincoln Blvd., Suite 116   
City, State: Oklahoma City, OK  73105    
 

       Telephone: 405-521-2289  
Fax:      405-522-1077   
E-mail: theresa.johnson@omes.ok.us   
 

4.  Authorized Dealers:  The following dealers are authorized to perform services.  
        Indicate “All” or separately list or exclude specific dealers 
A list of authorized dealers is attached hereto as Schedule 1.  Authorized dealers are not “subcontractors” as such 
term is used in Central Purchasing Rules.  Contractor is not responsible for the actions or omissions of authorized 
dealers. 
 
This Addendum and the associated Master Agreement together with its exhibits, set forth the entire agreement between 
the parties with respect to the subject matter of all previous communications, representations or agreements, whether 
oral or written, with respect to the subject matter hereof. Terms and conditions inconsistent with, contrary or in 
addition to the terms and conditions of this Addendum and the Master Agreement, together with its exhibits, shall not 
be added to or incorporated into this Addendum or the Master Agreement and its exhibits, by any subsequent 
purchase order or otherwise, and any such attempts to add or incorporate such terms and conditions are hereby 
rejected. The terms and conditions of this Addendum and the Master Agreement and its exhibits shall prevail and 
govern in the case of any such inconsistent or additional terms. 
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